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SUMMER UV RESIN

WHAT YOU’LL NEED
•	Ribtex Clear UV Resin

•	Ribtex UV Resin Opaque Light Blue

•	Ribtex UV Resin Opaque Pink

•	Ribtex UV Resin Pink

•	Ribtex UV Torch

•	Ribtex Silicone Alphabet Mould 

•	Ribtex Silicone Earring Mould 

•	Ribtex UV Resin Polymer Clay Flowers

•	Ribtex Play Jewels Wood Flowers

•	Ribtex Millefiori Flower Shape Bead

•	Ribtex Jewellery Findings Screw in Eyes

•	Ribtex Jewellery Findings Jump Rings

•	Ribtex Jeweller Findings Shepherds Hook 
Earrings

•	Ribtex Jewellery Accessories Key Ring

INSTRUCTIONS

Resin Summer Alphabet Key chains:

Step 1 - Pour a small amount of clear resin 
into the Ribtex alphabet mould, place in 
millefiori flower beads and/or polymer clay 
flowers into the letter.

Step 2 - Fill remainder of letter with clear or 
colored resin. 

Step 3 - Leave in UV light to cure (natural 
sunlight or UV lamp/torch)

Step 4 - De-mould your project. Tip – Flip 
the mould upside down and leave under UV 
light to ensure both sides of your project is 
cured before de-moulding.

Step 5 - Use a screw in eye at the top of 
the resin letter, open a jump ring and loop 
through the screw in eye. 

Step 6 - Using the open jump ring place on a 
wooden flower and close ring. On the other 
side of the flower add another jump ring.

Step 7 - Loop onto the open jump ring the 
large split ring of the key chain and close. 

Resin Summer Earrings:

Step 1 - Place into the earring mould the 
polymer clay flowers, pour on top the 
opaque light blue resin. 

Step 2 - Cure/ dry by placing under UV 
lamp/torch or near natural sunlight. 

Step 3 - Once fully cured the resin will no 
longer by tacky, de-mould from the silicone. 

Step 4 - Open a jump ring and thread 
through the top of the resin piece, thread 
through a wooden flower and close.

Step 5 - At the other end of the wooden 
flower thread through another jump ring and 
the shepherds hook earring. Tip – Ensure 
you make two at a time for the perfect pair 
of earrings!

Resin Summer Coaster:

Step 1 - Place Ribtex Play Jewels Wooden 
Flowers into a coaster mould. 

Step 2 - Cover in clear resin to halfway, do 
not fill the whole mould. 

Step 3 - Cure/ dry by placing under UV 
lamp/torch or near natural sunlight. Tip – 
The larger and thicker the project the longer 
it may take to cure.

Step 4 - Once cured pour on coloured UV 
resin. Leave to cure under UV light. 

Step 5 - When fully cured the resin will no 
longer be sticky and can be easily de-
moulded from the silicone. 

EASY


